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              TELEHEALTH SPECIALIST SERVICE 
 

Dear Doctor, 
 
Telemed Health Services, in conjunction with Boulder-Rotary, is pleased to offer the Goldfields region a 
telehealth specialist service to support GP’s in the area. Several Perth based specialists have made 
themselves available for free, no out-of-pocket telehealth consultations. 
 
We would like to introduce the following specialists: 
 
Dr Oyekoya Ayonrinde - Gastroenterologist 
 
Dr Koya Ayonrinde is a Gastroenterologist and Hepatologist working exclusively in the southern suburbs of 
Perth in the public and private sector. He is a staff specialist at Fiona Stanley Hospital and Fremantle 
Hospital and provides endoscopy services at Bentley Hospital under the ASI program and as a visiting 
medical practitioner (direct referral of uninsured public patients). He has admitting rights to St John of God 
Murdoch Hospital, where he also performs day case colonoscopy or gastroscopy/ endoscopy procedures 
for privately referred patients. 
 
Koya has clinical and research interests in general gastroenterology and general hepatology, including 
bowel cancer and polyp screening, coeliac disease, peptic ulcer disease, functional dyspepsia and irritable 
bowel syndrome, abnormal LFTs, nonalcoholic and alcoholic fatty liver disease, cirrhosis, drug-induced, 
autoimmune and viral hepatitis. 
 
Dr Krishna Chikkaveerappa- Endocrinology 

Dr Krish graduated from Bangalore (India) in 2000. He underwent physician and specialist endocrinology 
training in Liverpool (UK) and worked as a consultant in the UK. Dr Krish have fellowships from the UK, 
Ireland and Australia. He has a special interest in and holds post-graduate qualifications in teaching in 
clinical practice. He also has a special research interest in diabetes. Currently, he is working as a consultant 
physician and endocrinologist at Rockingham General Hospital. Dr Krish has been actively involved in 
supporting medical students in his Physician coordinator role attached to The University of Western 
Australia and describes himself as passionate specialist in providing high level patient care and 
empowering patients in decision making. He values good communication with primary care physicians and 
patients. 

Dr Vinothkumar (Vino) Kavarthapol Jayaraman- Nephrology 
 
Vino (Dr Vinothkumar Kavarthapol Jayaraman) did postgraduate Infectious Diseases degree at UWA (2008) 
after completing M.B.B.S. He underwent physician training and specialisation in Nephrology and Internal 
Medicine and received FRACP in 2018. He practices in all areas of Nephrology from mild chronic kidney 
disease to end stage renal failure and manages patients who are on different dialysis modality. He works in 
the field of Internal medicine and Nephrology at Rockingham General Hospital, Fiona Stanley Hospital and 
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Peel Health Campus and is actively involved in teaching and clinical research. Apart from the above 
hospitals, Vino provides comprehensive specialist outpatient services at Peel Health campus, Antony Street 
Specialist Centre and Rockingham Specialist Centre. 
 
Dr Siong Hui- Infectious Diseases 
  
Dr Hui is a specialist in Infectious Diseases. He obtained his medical degree from the University of Auckland 
in 2002 and completed specialist training in Internal Medicine and Infectious Diseases in New South Wales. 
His areas of clinical interest include endocarditis and endovascular infections, skin / soft tissue / wound / 
diabetic foot infections, hepatitis B and C, infections due to multi-resistant organisms, mycobacterial 
infections and infections in the returned traveller.  
 
He reviews private patients at the Antony Street Specialist Centre, the St John of God Subiaco Hospital and 
the Hollywood Private Hospital. He is also a consultant at the Fiona Stanley Hospital and Rockingham 
General Hospital. He administers the Antimicrobial Stewardship (AMS) and Infection Prevention programs 
at the latter institution. He is active in clinical research concerning cellulitis and hepatitis C, and also 
conducts AMS-related audits. He had been involved in the training of general practitioners in the 
management of hepatitis B and C under the auspices of the Australasian Society for Sexual Health 
Medicine (ASHM). 

Dr Charlie Ranaweera – General Physician & Diabetologist 

 
 
Our goal is to help Goldfields resident’s access private tele-specialist clinicians within a week of receiving a 
referral letter from their GP at our dedicated telehealth room, adjacent to Kalgoorlie Medical Imaging at 20 
Maritana St, Kalgoorlie. Consults will be co-ordinated by our local staff dedicated to managing your 
patients’ needs and co-ordinating the service with your practice to ensure GP’s remain at the core of 
clinical management.  
 

Please do not hesitate to contact me on 0409 900 463 or p.tually@telemed.net.au for any further details 
and I look forward to meeting with you again soon. 

Yours faithfully,  

 
 
Pete Tually, ANMT, FACHI. 
Director,  
TeleMed.    
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